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7 Conclusions
Image processing and transmission in WSNs has been
extensively researched and developed in various appli-
cation services, including traffic flow monitoring sys-
tem, vehicle license plate recognition, etc. For
gathering, processing, and transporting the image big
data, we study the image transmission with oppor-
tunistic networking technology, which select the op-
timal relay sensors based on the real-time status
including remaining energy and computing ability.
Then, we research the image processing with general-
ized Gaussian mixture algorithm, which could com-
press the big image data effectively and eliminate the
interference noise of image data caused in network
transmission progress. In our work, we have proposed

the adaptive image processing and transmission scheme
based on the combination of the above technology,
called GGMON. It aims to improve the QoS perform-
ance of image transmission in WSNs while maintaining
the high quality of image at receiving sensor. Experi-
mental results on mathematical analysis and simulation
show that the proposed scheme could obtain the better
performance for image processing and transmission in
WSNs.
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